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“Joseph was taken to Egypt, but God helped him rise 
to power!” (Stretch your scarf high like you’re lifting 
someone up.)

“Later, Joseph’s family, God’s people, moved to 
Egypt, and God’s people grew.” (Wave your scarf 
wide, like a growing crowd.)

“A new Pharaoh was scared of God’s people since 
there were so many. He made them work so hard!” 
(Pretend to push heavy things with your scarf.)

“Pharaoh wanted to hurt baby boys, but one brave 
family hid baby Moses.” (Crumple your scarf like a 
blanket and pretend to place it into a basket.)

“The princess found baby Moses and took care of 
him like he was her own son!” (Make a heart shape 
with your scarf.)

“When Moses grew up, he tried to protect some of 
God’s people, but he made trouble instead. So, 
Moses ran away and lived a quiet life until . . .”

“God called to Moses through a bush that burned 
but didn’t burn up!” (Wave your scarf quickly like a 
flickering flame.)

“God had heard the cries of His people and wanted 
Moses to lead the rescue mission to help them!” 

God told Moses: “I will be with you.” (Wrap your scarf 
around your shoulders like a hug.)

“Moses didn’t feel ready! He was nervous to speak.” 
(Cover your face with the scarf, like you are afraid.)

“But, God gave Moses lots of things to help him! God 
also told Moses that his brother Aaron would help 
him speak.” (Hand your scarf to a friend.)

“Finally, Moses trusted God and went. Moses and 
Aaron went to Pharaoh and said, ‘Let God’s people 
go!’” (Stomp your foot and swing your scarf.) 

“Pharaoh said no. So God sent plagues to show His 
power. Rivers to blood, frogs, bugs, darkness—SO 
many signs! Pharaoh still refused to let God’s people 
go! Then there was one final, terrible plague. God 
gave Moses special instructions to protect His 
people from the awful plague that was coming.” 
(Place the scarf over your head as if you are shielding 
yourself.) 

“God told the people to mark their doors with lamb’s 
blood, and that night, God protected them.” (Pretend 
to wipe your forehead with your scarf.)

“Everything happened as God had said. Egyptians 
were devastated, and Pharaoh let God’s people go! 
They packed quickly and followed God.” (Hold your 
scarf over your back like a backpack.) 

“But the Pharaoh changed his mind again! God’s 
people were stuck between the Egyptian army and 
the Red Sea. It was so scary!” (Freeze your scarf like 
it’s frozen in fear.)

“The sea was in front of God’s people, but God made 
a way for His people to make it across!” (Push your 
scarf out to the sides like parting water.) 

“God saved His people and they praised God!” 
(Throw your scarf up in celebration!)

“Just like the lamb’s blood saved God’s people, Jesus 
gave His life to save us.” (Pretend your scarf is the 
cross and hug it tight.)


