
Ephesians 4:17-32 Cross References

Intro
Galatians 
5:16–18

16 But I say, walk by the Spirit, and you will not gratify 
the desires of the flesh. 17 For the desires of the flesh are 
against the Spirit, and the desires of the Spirit are 
against the flesh, for these are opposed to each other, to 
keep you from doing the things you want to do. 18 But if 
you are led by the Spirit, you are not under the law. 

Galatians 
5:24–25

24 And those who belong to Christ Jesus have crucified 
the flesh with its passions and desires. 25 If we live by 
the Spirit, let us also keep in step with the Spirit. 

Ephesians 
4:1

I therefore, a prisoner for the Lord, urge you to walk in a 
manner worthy of the calling to which you have been 
called, 

1 John 2:1–
6

1 My little children, I am writing these things to you so 
that you may not sin. But if anyone does sin, we have an 
advocate with the Father, Jesus Christ the righteous. 2 
He is the propitiation for our sins, and not for ours only 
but also for the sins of the whole world. 3 And by this we 
know that we have come to know him, if we keep his 
commandments. 4 Whoever says “I know him” but does 
not keep his commandments is a liar, and the truth is 
not in him, 5 but whoever keeps his word, in him truly 
the love of God is perfected. By this we may know that 
we are in him: 6 whoever says he abides in him ought to 
walk in the same way in which he walked. 

vv. 17-19
Romans 
1:18–25

18 For the wrath of God is revealed from heaven against 
all ungodliness and unrighteousness of men, who by 
their unrighteousness suppress the truth. 19 For what 
can be known about God is plain to them, because God 
has shown it to them. 20 For his invisible attributes, 
namely, his eternal power and divine nature, have been 
clearly perceived, ever since the creation of the world, in 
the things that have been made. So they are without 
excuse. 21 For although they knew God, they did not 
honor him as God or give thanks to him, but they 
became futile in their thinking, and their foolish hearts 
were darkened. 22 Claiming to be wise, they became 
fools, 23 and exchanged the glory of the immortal God 
for images resembling mortal man and birds and 
animals and creeping things. 24 Therefore God gave 
them up in the lusts of their hearts to impurity, to the 
dishonoring of their bodies among themselves, 25 
because they exchanged the truth about God for a lie and 
worshiped and served the creature rather than the 
Creator, who is blessed forever! Amen. 

vv. 20-24
2 
Corinthian
s 5:17

Therefore, if anyone is in Christ, he is a new creation. 
The old has passed away; behold, the new has come. 

Romans 
12:2

Do not be conformed to this world, but be transformed 
by the renewal of your mind, that by testing you may 
discern what is the will of God, what is good and 
acceptable and perfect. 

vv. 25-30
John 2:13–
17

13 The Passover of the Jews was at hand, and Jesus went 
up to Jerusalem. 14 In the temple he found those who 
were selling oxen and sheep and pigeons, and the 
money-changers sitting there. 15 And making a whip of 
cords, he drove them all out of the temple, with the 
sheep and oxen. And he poured out the coins of the 
money-changers and overturned their tables. 16 And he 
told those who sold the pigeons, “Take these things 
away; do not make my Father’s house a house of trade.” 
17 His disciples remembered that it was written, “Zeal 
for your house will consume me.” 

Mark 3:5 And he looked around at them with anger, grieved at 
their hardness of heart, and said to the man, “Stretch out 
your hand.” He stretched it out, and his hand was 
restored. 

Hebrews 
12:14–15

14 Strive for peace with everyone, and for the holiness 
without which no one will see the Lord. 15 See to it that 
no one fails to obtain the grace of God; that no “root of 
bitterness” springs up and causes trouble, and by it 
many become defiled; 

Philippians 
3:8

Indeed, I count everything as loss because of the 
surpassing worth of knowing Christ Jesus my Lord. For 
his sake I have suffered the loss of all things and count 
them as rubbish, in order that I may gain Christ 

1 Kings 
18:27

And at noon Elijah mocked them, saying, “Cry aloud, for 
he is a god. Either he is musing, or he is relieving 
himself, or he is on a journey, or perhaps he is asleep 
and must be awakened.” 

Galatians 
5:12

I wish those who unsettle you would emasculate 
themselves! 

James 
3:8–12

8 but no human being can tame the tongue. It is a 
restless evil, full of deadly poison. 9 With it we bless our 
Lord and Father, and with it we curse people who are 
made in the likeness of God. 10 From the same mouth 
come blessing and cursing. My brothers, these things 
ought not to be so. 11 Does a spring pour forth from the 
same opening both fresh and salt water? 12 Can a fig 
tree, my brothers, bear olives, or a grapevine produce 
figs? Neither can a salt pond yield fresh water. 

Luke 6:45 The good person out of the good treasure of his heart 
produces good, and the evil person out of his evil 
treasure produces evil, for out of the abundance of the 
heart his mouth speaks. 

Romans 
6:1–2

1 What shall we say then? Are we to continue in sin that 
grace may abound? 2 By no means! How can we who 
died to sin still live in it? 

vv. 31-32
Romans 
6:23

For the wages of sin is death, but the free gift of God is 
eternal life in Christ Jesus our Lord. 

Galatians 
5:16

But I say, walk by the Spirit, and you will not gratify the 
desires of the flesh. 

1 John 
1:8–9

8 If we say we have no sin, we deceive ourselves, and the 
truth is not in us. 9 If we confess our sins, he is faithful 
and just to forgive us our sins and to cleanse us from all 
unrighteousness. 

Hebrews 
10:10–14

10 And by that will we have been sanctified through the 
offering of the body of Jesus Christ once for all. 11 And 
every priest stands daily at his service, offering 
repeatedly the same sacrifices, which can never take 
away sins. 12 But when Christ had offered for all time a 
single sacrifice for sins, he sat down at the right hand of 
God, 13 waiting from that time until his enemies should 
be made a footstool for his feet. 14 For by a single 
offering he has perfected for all time those who are being 
sanctified. 

Romans 
10:9

because, if you confess with your mouth that Jesus is 
Lord and believe in your heart that God raised him from 
the dead, you will be saved. 
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