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Instead of Just Reading the Bible, Let’s Visualize It 
 
When we are reading the Bible, we must receive the help of 
the Holy Ghost to reveal to us what we are reading. 
 
John 16:13-15 KJV Howbeit when He, the Spirit of truth, is 
come, He will guide you into all truth: for He shall not speak of 
Himself; but whatsoever He shall hear, that shall He speak: 
and He will shew you things to come. [14] He shall glorify Me: 
for He shall receive of Mine, and shall shew it unto you. [15] 
All things that the Father hath are Mine: therefore said I, that 
He shall take of mine, and shall shew it unto you. 
 
God the Father sent Jesus to the earth to die for our sins so 
that we wouldn’t go to hell and be punished forever. But, He 
also sent Jesus to educate us spiritually through the Holy 
Ghost. We are baby Christians, when we first receive our 
spiritual new birth. After that, we must grow so that we can 
live out our new spiritual life in Christ. The way Christians 
grow is through understanding what God understands. Our 
Father God has written us a text book called the Bible so that 
we can learn and grow. In today’s Newsletter, I want to tell 
you some simple things that will cause you to be able to have 
a wonderful spiritual life. 
 



We must understand what God understands. When you read 
the Bible, don’t just read words and move on to another 
reading. Visualize what you are reading. Use your imagination 
with the Holy Ghost’s help, and He will give you revelation so 
that you can understand what you’re reading. 
 
Let’s look at some more Scriptures, and let the Holy Ghost 
give you understanding. 
 
1 Corinthians 2:12-14 KJV Now we have received, not the 
spirit of the world, but the Spirit which is of God; that we might 
know the things that are freely given to us of God. [13] Which 
things also we speak, not in the words which man's wisdom 
teacheth, but which the Holy Ghost teacheth; comparing 
spiritual things with spiritual. [14] But the natural man 
receiveth not the things of the Spirit of God: for they are 
foolishness unto him: neither can he know them, because 
they are spiritually discerned. 
 
In these verses we see that God, the Holy Ghost, wants to 
teach us so that we can know what God knows. When I’m 
reading the Bible, I stop and ask the Holy Ghost to reveal to 
me what the Bible is saying. It’s so awesome to get this 
understanding coming up from my spirit into my mind. 
Scripture verses will get you to a level in spiritual maturity that 
the devil will have a hard time winning against you. 
 



As I close, I want to show you how to become a spiritual giant 
in the Lord. When you are listening to someone that you know 
is speaking for the Lord, get the Scripture verse that they are 
preaching or teaching from and study them personally until 
you can start understanding what they mean. Use the 
teachers’ understanding until you get your own. The reason 
we want to do this is so we can work the works of God. We 
are His workers, or employees, on the earth. Our Father God 
wants us to get mankind saved, and then He wants to teach 
His children so they can grow up spiritually. 
 
Love you, 
Pastor Paul 
 
This Week’s Daily Bible Readings                      
Monday       Acts 9 
 
Tuesday       Acts 10 
 
Wednesday  Acts 11 
 
Thursday     Acts 12 
 
Friday       Acts 13 
 
Saturday    Acts 14 
 
Sunday      Acts 15 



 
 
STAY CONNECTED        
** If you need prayer, call our Prayer Line 580-704-0505    
 
** The Christian Center app- 
https://subsplash.com/thechristiancenter/app 
 
** You can text to give through the TCC app.  
 
REGULAR ACTIVITIES          
Daily 
*Early Morning Prayer: Sanctuary M-F 6:15-7:15am  
 
*Women’s Dance Aerobics: M-F 10-11am in Gym 
 
*Noonday Bible Study: M-F 12:15 in Sanctuary or  91.1fm or 
live stream on TCC app    
 
Weekly 
** Sunday Services: 9:45am classes; 10:45am Main Service 
 
** Monday Night Care Group: Under balcony 7pm 
 
** Wednesday Night Prayer: 6pm in NW Classroom 
 
** Wednesday Night:  Adult & Youth Services 7pm 
 

https://subsplash.com/thechristiancenter/app


** MobilePrayer:Fri 2-3:30pm Hobby Lobby parking lot 
 
** Friday Night Prayer: 7pm under balcony 
 
Monthly      
*** Men’s Fellowship: 1st Sat. 9am at Golden Corral 
 
*** Crosses at the Corner: 1st Sat. 11am-1pm corner of 
Sheridan/Cache Rd.    
 
*** Women's Fellowship:3rd Sat.9am Golden Corral                      
 
*** Relationship Class: 4th Sat.10am-12 Fellowship Hall 


