
Topic Stronger … Faith for Finances

Scripture
Philippians 4:19
And my God will liberally supply (fill until full) your every 
need according to His riches in glory in Christ Jesus.

Definition

Finances - The management of money and revenues, 
the conduct or transaction of money matters. Monetary 
resources, a supply of money or capital. Any article or 
substance used as a medium of exchange, measure of 
wealth, or means of payment.

Prayer Tools

1. Thank God for all the blessing, gifts, abilities and fi-
nancial means He has given to you. (Matt 7:9-11)

2. Ask God to give you strategies in how to stay out or 
get out of debt. 

3. Pray to be a good steward of all that God has given 
you and how you can help others.

4. Pray God to help you to be faithful to your House of 
Worship by giving your tithes and offerings.

Leader’s Prayer  5-6 minutes max

Closing
Collective Prayer

God thank you that your Word says that you will supply 
all of my needs according to Your riches in glory.  It 
also says that if I seek first Your kingdom and Your 
righteousness You will provide everything I need. Lord 
give me the wisdom to be a good steward of the 
resources you have given me. Help me learn the secret 
of being content in any and every situation. Jesus help 
me change my habits and mindset to eliminate and not 
get in debt. Place in me  a giving heart to help those 
around me and specially being faithful to my church by 
giving my 10%. Help me rest “that if you take care of 
the birds of in the air, that do not sow or reap and you 
take care of them, how much more you will take care of 
my needs” in Jesus Christ, Amen
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